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A 35-year-old female presented to her 
dermatologist with generalized pruritus. She 
was prescribed Hydroxyzine with minimal 
relief but did not return to her dermatologist 
for follow-up. After 2 years from the initial 
onset of her pruritic symptoms she began to 
develop progressively worsening dyspnea, 
and went to see her primary care physician. 
Her primary care provider ordered a chest x-
ray, which revealed a large mediastinal 
mass, prompting an urgent referral to the 
emergency department. 
 
A review of systems was negative for classic 
B-symptoms such as fevers, chills, weight 
loss, as well as any skin lesions, rash, or 
pain. Overall, the patient appeared well, with 
the physical exam showing bilaterally 
decreased breath sounds and excoriations 
on her abdomen and extremities. (Figure 1) 
Her vital signs were within normal limits. 
 
A computed tomography (CT) scan revealed 
a large mediastinal mass encasing the 
majority of great vessels, including the upper 
aorta and compressing the brachiocephalic 
veins and superior vena cava (SVC). (Figure 
2) Further workup confirmed the diagnosis of 
Hodgkin’s lymphoma and the appropriate 

therapy was initiated. Treatment of her tumor 
resulted in symptomatic improvement, 
strongly suggesting a paraneoplastic 
etiology. 
 
Hodgkin’s lymphoma typically progresses 
indolently, often presenting with 
asymptomatic lymphadenopathy as the most 
common sign. Constitutional symptoms such 
as fever, chills, and night sweats occur in less 
than half of cases. Pruritus is even rarer but 
can serve as an ominous sign of a poorer 
prognosis.1 In this case, the patient’s 
symptoms were relieved with treatment of the 
malignancy. 
 
Pruritus is an extremely common nonspecific 
finding in numerous conditions, including 
benign dermatoses like eczema or irritant 
dermatitis. Patients presenting with chronic 
pruritus without a primary skin disorder 
require a thorough history and physical 
examination to identify any underlying 
systemic illness.2 Symptoms refractory to 
anti-pruritic therapy should increase 
suspicion for serious underlying pathology, 
such as uremia secondary to renal failure, 
iron deficiency anemia, polycythemia, 
hyperthyroidism, Hepatitis C, HIV, or occult  
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Figure 1. Physical exam showing excoriations over the abdomen (Left) and lower extremities 
(Right) on physical exam. 
 

 
Figure 2. Computed Tomography Scan displaying a large (15.28 cm) mass in the mediastinum. 
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malignancy may be involved.3,4  When  
appropriate, common relevant laboratory 
testing can include a complete metabolic 
panel (CMP), complete blood count (CBC), 
HIV testing, and thyroid function tests, as well 
as a chest radiograph.5 In cases like this one, 
involving Hodgkin’s lymphoma, urgent 
consultation with an oncologist for initiation of 
anti-cancer therapy is essential.6 In similar 
cases seen in both children and adults, 
patients suffering from intractable pruritus 
improved vastly with initiation of 
chemotherapy for lymphoma.7,8 
 
Even in the absence of systemic disease, the 
impact of chronic pruritus on quality of life 
should not be underestimated, and 
appropriate treatment should be provided.6 
Common treatment options include oral 
therapies such as antihistamines, 
anticonvulsants, and antidepressants as well 
as topical forms of steroids, capsaicin, and 
calcineurin inhibitors.2 Continuing research 
into the specific cytokines that may cause 
lymphoma-associated pruritus may 
eventually result in targeted therapies for 
palliation in these patients.9 
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